Lost Creek Clay and Mineral, LLC voleeiNo: 42542

933 Mackey Boshell Road
Jasper, AL 35501
(205)522-6823 Phone INVOICE
Customer IBoral Brick Inc Misc |
Name Boral Brick Inc Date 6/21/2016
Address 8250 Hopewell Rd SE Order No. 767318
City Bessemer State AL ZIP 35022 Rep ML
Phone 205-275-1290
Date |Description Tons SurCharge | Unit Price TOTAL
801.0089.00000
6/13/2016 |through 6/16/16 Truck Ids 134 3483.74 $ 2100 $ 73,158.54
134 3483.74
$ 73,158.54
Total Taxes | § -

Payment | Select One...
Comments TOTAL | $ 73,158.54 |

Name

CC# Office Use Only

Expires




CW McGehee

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

shawn robinson <lostcreekclayandminerall@gmail.com>
Thursday, August 11, 2016 8:21 AM

CW McGehee

Fwd: FYI: Remittance Advice (***Do not reply to this Email***)

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Workflow Mailer <wfprd@boral.com>

Date: June 22, 2016 at 2:01:12 PM CDT

To: LOST CREEK CLAY AND MINERAL <lostcreekclayandminerall (@gmail.com>
Subject: FYI: Remittance Advice (***Do not reply to this Email**¥)

Reply-To: <wfprd@boral.com>

To

Sent
ID

LOST CREEK CLAY AND
MINERAL

22-JUN-16 14:56:34
1976917

From: BB:Boral Bricks - The following payment has been remitted:

Payment Number: 2529664
Payment Date: 24-JUN-2016
Payment Currency: USD
Payment Amount: 73,158.54

Invoice Number Invoice Date Discount Taken Amount Paid _To

42542

21-JUN-2016 73,158.54~ LOST CREEK CLAY AND MINERAL

*#¥*DO NOT REPLY TO THIS EMAIL
**¥You can email questions to help.desk@boral.com

Thank you,
Boral Payables Dept.

NOTICE: This email message and all attachments are for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential
and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not read, disseminate, distribute, copy or otherwise use
this message or its attachments. If you have received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy
all electronic and paper copies of the original message. Thank you.




